
Why the Reserve Bank spoke up on climate change
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WhenReserveBankofAustraliadeputy
governorGuyDebellebrokenewgroundfor
theinstitutionthisweekbypubliclywarning
oftheeconomicdangersposedbyclimate
change,hedidsoafterextensiveinternal
deliberationsinsidethecentralbank.
Theeconomicandfinancial impactsof

climatechangehave increasinglybeen
exercisingthemindsofmonetarypolicy
makers inrecentyearsandDebelle felt it
wastimefor the independentRBAtogeton
thefront foot.
IndoingsoDebellewasunderliningthat

climatechange isnotsimplyatopic for
scientificandpoliticaldebate,but that the
centralbankbelieves ithasrealand
permanentconsequences for theeconomy,
businessandfinancialmarkets.
Sowhydidhespeakoutso forthrightlyon

suchafraughtpolitical issuethat isonce
againtearingapart theCoalition
governmentandhascostat least three
primeministers their jobs?
Thepioneeringspeech, teedupabout

six monthsago,coincidedwithQueensland
NationalsMPsrevoltingovercoal
and climatechangepoliciesagainst

their Liberalcolleagues.
Debelle,aPhDeconomistwhostudiedat

theprestigiousMassachusetts Instituteof
Technology, startedfromthepremise that
regardlessofwhat iscausingglobal
warming,climatechange ishavingafirst-
ordermacroeconomic impact.Hesaid
climatechangeposeda ‘‘systemicrisk’’ to
theeconomy.
‘‘Forbusinessesandfinancialmarkets,

thatchallenge isunderstandingtheclimate
modellingandconductingthescenario
analysis todetermine thepotential impact
ontheirbusinessandinvestments,’’hesaid
ataneventhostedbytheCentre forPolicy
Development.
Thereare threemainreasonswhythe

banknowranksclimatechangealongside
other factors that impactontheeconomyin
theshortandlongterm.
First, climatechange is influencingthe

power investmentmixandelectricity
prices, includingfor increasinglypopular
renewableenergy.
Theboominrenewableenergy

investmentsover thepast twoyears isnot
only impactingenergyprices in the
economy; it’salsoshiftingtheoverall
businesscapitalexpenditurenumbers.
Second, the increasedfrequencyand

severityofextremeweathereventsare
affecting industriesacross theeconomy,
suchasagriculture.

Third, inyears tocomedamageto
attractionssuchas theGreatBarrierReef
mayhurt tourism,oneofAustralia’s largest
exportsearning$37billionayear.
Debelle’sunderlyingmessagewasthe

earlierpolicymakersandbusiness take
actionagainstclimatechange, the lowerthe
economiccosts.
Theslowerand lateractionoccurs, the

sharper theeconomiccorrectionandthe
more it is irreversible.
‘‘Financial stabilitywillbebetterserved

byanorderly transitionrather thanan

abruptdisorderlyone,’’hesaid.
At theRBA’sMartinPlace inSydney, two

membersof thenine-personRBAboard
haveadeep interest inclimateand
energy policy.
WendyCraik is thechairof the

government’sClimateChangeAuthority
andCatherineTanna ischiefexecutiveof
EnergyAustralia.Tannahasexperienced
thepoliticalmismanagementofenergy
policyover the lastdecadethathascreated
investmentuncertaintyandcausedthe
under-investment inpowergenerationthat

has, in turn,contributed toahugespike in
electricityprices forhouseholdsand
business.
‘‘For thepastdecadeenergypolicy in

Australiahasbeenmired inaclimatewar,’’
Tannasaid inaNovemberspeech.
‘‘There’snonational frameworkand

familieshavepaidaheavyprice.’’

Debelle’smessagebacksupasimilar
clarioncall fromBankofEnglandgovernor
MarkCarney,whowarned lastyearof the
‘‘catastrophic impact’’ climatechangecould
havefor thefinancial systemunless
companiesdomore todisclose their
vulnerabilities.
Prudentialandsecuritiesregulators,

includingtheAustralianPrudential
RegulationAuthorityandAustralian
SecuritiesandInvestmentsCommission,
havewarnedlistedcompanies theymust
improvemarketdisclosures toaccount for
theirpotentialexposuresandbusinessrisks
fromclimatechange.
Insurershavebeenglobal leaders.

ResourcesgiantBHPisdisclosingthe
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The later action occurs,
the sharper the
economic correction
and themore it is
irreversible.

Guy Debelle and
Catherine Tanna,
below, have both
warned of the
negative economic
impacts of climate
change.

emissions inventory in itsvaluechain.
Global fundsmanagementgiants

BlackRockandVanguardarebacking
voluntary-climatechangereporting
standards forpubliccompanies.
Debellesaideconomistsmustdoabetter

jobofmapping theclimatechange
modelling intomacroeconomicmodels.
‘‘Weneedto thinkabouthowthe

economyiscurrentlyadaptingandhowit
willadaptbothto thetrendchange in
climateandthe transitionrequiredto
containclimatechange.’’
Debellewasnotflagginganychangeto

theRBA’s traditional inflation-targeting
monetarypolicy framework.
Yet inaworldwhereextremeweather

eventssuchasdroughtaremorecommonit
willbeharder for theRBAtouse its
traditional ‘‘lookthrough’’ impactonthe

feconomyandprices ifanyclimate-induced
supplyshock ispermanent. P
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